
Contractor Name Location Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2
Bid 

Bond

AVM Contractors, LLC Charlotte, NC 404,307.00$          4,620.00$            2,063.00$       404,307.00$           4,620.00$           2,063.00$         Y

H&C Contracting, Inc. Charlotte, NC 410,000.00$          2,000.00$            1,500.00$       440,000.00$           2,000.00$           1,500.00$         Y

Hostetter and Son Construction, Inc. Charlotte, NC 415,000.00$          7,900.00$            7,500.00$       410,000.00$           7,900.00$           7,500.00$         Y

Ground Thunder Construction, Inc. Charlotte, NC 437,037.83$          No Bid No Bid 437,037.83$           No Bid No Bid Y

G.W. Lyles Construction Co.,Inc. Concord, NC 453,800.00$          9,770.00$            1,100.00$       453,800.00$           9,770.00$           1,100.00$         Y

Dave's Construction Service, Inc. Eden, NC 457,554.00$          2,070.00$            4,933.00$       472,584.00$           2,070.00$           4,933.00$         Y

Pinnix, Inc. Gastonia, NC 482,600.00$          8,700.00$            5,000.00$       463,100.00$           8,700.00$           500.00$            Y

Neill Grading & Construction Hickory, NC 486,100.00$          8,250.00$            4,200.00$       486,100.00$           8,250.00$           4,200.00$         Y

V Stewart McKee Morganton, NC 499,062.00$          14,336.00$          5,412.00$       499,062.00$           14,336.00$        5,412.00$         Y

Miles-McClellan Construction Company Charlotte, NC 574,000.00$          3,000.00$            3,000.00$       539,000.00$           3,000.00$           3,000.00$         Y

90 Days 180 Days

BID TAB SUMMARY
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